RESOLUTION NO. 2019 - 45 7

A RESOLUTION BY THE BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS OF ST. JOHNS COUNTY,
FLORIDA, AUTHORIZING THE COUNTY ADMINISTRATOR, OR DESIGNEE, TO PURCHASE
AND TO EXECUTE A PURCHASE ORDER FOR ONE (1) REPLACEMENT CAPTERPILLAR
926M WHEEL LOADER FOR THE ROAD & BRIDGE DEPARTMENT

RECITALS

WHEREAS, the County seeks to purchase one (1) Replacement Caterpillar926M Wheel Loader for the
Road & Bridge Department; and

WHEREAS, in accordance with section 302.6.5.4 of the St. Johns County Purchasing Manual, entitled
"Piggyback or Cooperative Purchasing”, the County is authorized to make said purchase subject to the terms
and conditions of Florida Sheriff’s Association Contract #FSA18-VEH16.0 ("Contract"); and

WHEREAS, purchase of the equipment will be funded by the Road & Bridge Department; and

WHEREAS, the County has reviewed the terms, provisions, conditions and requirements of the
Contract and finds that entering into the Contract for purchase of the loader serves a public purpose.

NOW, THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED BY THE BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
OF ST. JOHNS COUNTY, FLORIDA, as follows:

Section 1. The above Recitals are incorporated by reference into the body of this Resolution and such
Recitals are adopted as finds of fact.

Section 2. The County Administrator, or designee, is hereby authorized to purchase one (1) Replacement
Caterpillar 926M Wheel Loader.

Section 3. In accordance with the terms and conditions of the Contract, the County Administrator, or
designee, is further authorized to execute a purchase order in the amount of $172,502.00 for the purchase of
one (1) Replacement Caterpillar 926M Wheel Loader from Ring Power Corporation.

Section 4. To the extent that there are typographical and/or administrative errors that do not change the
tone, tenor, or concept of this Resolution, then this Resolution may be revised without subsequent approval
by the Board of County Commissioners.

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of County Commissioners of St. Johns County, Florida, this
I'Tth day of Decembes, 2019,

BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS OF
ST. JOHNS COUN;I'Y, FLORIDA

By, NEAdA

ATTEST: Brandon Patty, Clerk €b S. Smith, Chair
By: )4%4 '
Lt RENDITION DATE_/2/29 /) 9 e



Ring l CAT

Ring Power Corporation
500 World Commerce Parkway
St. Augustine, FL 32092

QUOTE PER THE FLORIDA SHERIFF'S ASSOCIATION CONTRACT

Quote Prepared For: 11/7/2019
St Johns County
(1) NEW CATERPILLAR 926 M WHEEL LOADER

CONTRACT DETAILS

Florida Sheriff's Association

Bid # FSA18-VEH16.0

Specification # 33, 3.0 Cu. Yd. Wheel Loader and Options

Contract Rollover Dates: October-1, 2019 Through September 30, 2020

BASE MACHINE

BASE Caterpillar 926M Per Sheriff's Contract Specifications ~$139,837

3.4% CPI Rollover Sheriff's Contract Increase $4,922
TOTAL OF BASE MACHINE $144,759

MACRINE SPECIFICATIONS

430-2943
430-2821
430-2996
333-6528
430-2855

454-0609 -

430-3038
423-7152
423-7200
488-1112
342-0130
454-0589
366-6895
366-8148
348-2579
519-8081
0P-2491
345-2824
8E-4566

PREP PACK, UNITED STATES

HYD,2V,PIN-ON,STD LIFT

STEERING, STANDARD

DIFFERENTIAL, OPEN REAR

ENVIRONMENT, STANDARD

WEATHER, STANDARD

ENGINE - AR

CAB, STANDARD

SEAT, STANDARD

LIGHTS, STD HALOGEN ,
RADIO, READY )
PRODUCT LINK, CELLULAR PL641

TIRES, 20.5R25 MX XTLA * L2

FENDERS, STANDARD

COUNTERWEIGHT, HEAVY

TOOLBOX, AUX, NONE

KIT,SERIALIZED TECHNICAL MEDIA

BUCKET, GP, 3.2YD3, PO

CUTTING EDGE, BOLT ON({4 PIECE)




" SPECIFIED OPTIONS

430-2977 QUICK COUPLER, FUSION $2,752
333-1369 RADIOQ, CD, DELUXE ! $632
521-3244 CAB, DELUXE $1,980
423-7201 SEAT, DELUXE 5702
377-5635 CAMERA, REAR VIEW 5702
349-8165 GUARD, POWERTRAIN, LOWER $915
425-1425 GUARD, POWERTRAIN, SIDE $356
349-8163 GUARD, CRANKCASE $629
488-1114 LIGHTS, AUX LED $602
362-0902 BUCKET, MP, 2.7YD3, FUSION w/ EDGE $18,708
SUBTOTAL $27,978
3.4% CPI Rollover Sheriff's Contract Increase $985
TOTAL OF SPECIFIED OPTIONS $28,963 l
NON-SPECIFIED OPTIONS
349-7940 GUARD, DRIVESHAFT $605
345-2824 BUCKET, GP, 3.2YD3, PO (56,012)
8E-4566 CUTTING EDGE, BOLT ON(4 PIECE) (5525)
430-2853 HYD,3V,COUPLER READY,HIGH LIFT $8,980
SUB TOTAL $3,048
3.4% CPI Rollover Sheriff's Contract Increase $107
SUBTOTAL $3,155
LESS 25% SHERIFF'S CONTRACT DISCOUNT ($789)
TOTAL OF NON-SPECIFIED OPTIONS $2,366 |
CAT WORK TOOLS
345-2417 CARRIAGE, PALLET FORK 60" 52,610
371-2354 FORK TINE, 2,25" X 6" X 54" S 986/each $1,872
SUB TOTAL $4,482
3.4% CPI Rollover Sheriff's Contract Increase 5158
SUBTOTAL $4,640
LESS 16% SHERIFF'S CONTRACT DISCOUNT (5742)
TOTAL OF CAT WORK TOOLS $3,897 |
SUBTOTAL $179,985
LESS ONE TIME ADDITIONAL DISCOUNT (67.,483)
TOTAL TRANSACTION PRICE $172,502 |

Best regards,

Shaun Mitchell
Sales Representative
Ring Power Corporation



CONTRACT RENEWAL

MVl Contract Number: FSA18-VEH16.0

\@y Contract Name: Cab & Chassis Trucks and Heavy Equipment

Renewal Period: October 1, 2019 — September 30, 2020

The Florida Sheriffs Association (FSA) has renewed, through mutual agreement with awarded
vendors, select specifications within Contract FSA18-VEH16.0, Cab & Chassis Trucks and Heavy
Equipment. This contract renewal is in accordance with Section 3.04 Option to Renew with Price
Adjustment of the Contract Terms and Conditions." Awarded vendors on this list have executed
agreements signed as Addendum #3, dated July 1, 2019.

The price increases associated with this contract renewal are based on the Producer Price Index
(PPI}) as published by the U.S. Department of Labor, Bureau of Labor Statistics. This extension
authorizes a price adjustment for each product listed and applies to the published options.
Option pricing must remain below MSRP. Price increases may not exceed the published percent.
FSA has published a schedule listing the authorized PPl percent to each item {Contract Renewal
PPI Schedule).

To utilize this contract renewal, simply refer to criginal contract for the product under Contract
FSA18-VEH16.0, Cab & Chassis Trucks and Heavy Equipment. Contact the awarded vendor using
the Vendor Directory. To calculate the contract renewal price, use the original contract price and
the percent increase on the Contract Renewal PP| Schedule. '

Quotes from the awarded vendor must not exceed the original price plus the authorized PPI
percent listed on the Contract Renewal PPl Schedule document for each Group, Make, and
Model.

Options awarded with the item and Non-Scheduled Options shall be below Manufacturer
Suggested Retail Price (MSRP). Therefore, while options awarded with the item may be increased
according to the PPI, the final price may not exceed MSRP. See sections 2.13 and 3.17 of the
Contract Terms and Conditions.

The Terms and Conditions remain in effect for the extended period for these products.

Items not included in tﬁis list have been re-bid under Contract FSA19-VEH17.0 Heavy Trucks and
Equipment, to be awarded October 1, 2019.
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FSA18-VEH16.0 Cab Chassis Trucks and Heavy Equipment
Contract Extension Rollover

3.4% - Machinery Manufacturing 45 |Wheeled Hydraulic Excavator - 42,000 LB Operating Weight |Caterpillar M318 M318 Kelly Tractor
3.4% - Machinery Manufacturing a5 Wheeled Hydraulic Excavator - 42,000 LB Operating Weight |Caterpillar M318 M318 Ring Power
3.4% - Machinery Manufacturing 45 Wheeled Hydraulic Excavator - 42,000 LB Operating Weight {Doocsan DX210WE-5 DX210WE-5 Doosan
3.4% - Machinery Manufacturing 45 Wheeled Hydraulic Excavator - 42,000 LB Operating Weight [John Deere 190 GW 180 GW Dobbs Equipment
3.4% - Machinery Manufacturing 45 Wheeled Hydraulic Excavator - 42,000 LB Operating Weight |Volvo EW180E EW180E Cowin Equipment
3.4% - Machinery Manufacturing 45 Wheelad Hydraulic Excavator - 42,000 LB Operating Weight |Volvo EW180E EWI180E Flagler Construction Equipment
3.4% - Machinery Manufacturing 46 Telescopic Excavator - 45,000 LB Operating Weight - Track  |Gradall 4200 4200 Great Southern Equipment
3.4% - Machinery Manufacturing 47 Telescopic Excavator - 47,000 LB Operating Weight - 6X6 Gradall XL4100 XL4100 Great Southern Equipment

. o~ Wheel .
3.4% - Machinery Manufacturing 48 Compaction Vibratory Roller 30,000 LB - Single Drum Bomag BW177D-5 BW177D-5 Dobbs Equipment
3.4% - Machinéry Manufacturing 438 Compaction Vibratory Roller 30,000 LB - Single Drum Caterpillar CS44 CS44 Cowin Equipment
3.4% - Machinery Manufacturing 48 Compaction Vibratory Roller 30,000 LB - Single Drum . |Caterpillar csad 844 Flagler Construction Equipment
3.4% - Machinery Manufacturing 48 Compaction Vibratory Roller 30,000 LB - Single Drum Caterpillar CS44 Cs44 Kelly Tractor "
3.4% - Machinery Manufacturing 48 Compaction Vibratory Roller 30,000 LB - Single Drum Caterpillar CS44 CS44 Ring Power
3.4% - Machinery Manufacturing 48 Compaction Vibratory Roller 30,000 LB - Single Drum Sakai SV540 SV540 Great Southern Equipment
3.4% - Machinery Manufacturing 49 Small 5,400 LB Double Drum Roller - 47" Bomag BW1205L-5 BW1205L-5 Dobbs Equipment
3.4% - Machinery Manufacturing 49 Small 5,400 LB Double Drum Roller - 47" Case DV26 DV26 Trekker Tractor
3.4% - Machinery Manufacturing 49 Small 5,400 LB Double Drum Roller - 47" Caterpillar £B24B CB24B Kally Tractor
3.4% - Machinery Manufacturing 49 Small 5,400 LB Double Drum Roller - 47" Caterpillar CB24B CB24B Ring Power
3.4% - Machinery Manufacturing 49 Smali 5,400 LB Double Drum Roller - 47" Dynapac CC1200 | CC1200 Earthmovers
3.4% - Machinery Manufacturing 49 Small 5,400 LB Double Drum Roller - 47" Volvo DD25B DD258 Cowin Equipment
3.4% - Machinery Manufacturing 49 Small 5,400 LB Double Drum Roller - 47" Volvo DD25B DD25B Flagler Construction Equipment
3.4% - Machinery Manufacturing 50 Large 22,000 LB Double Drum Roller - 70" Bomag BW190AD-5 BW1S0AD-5 Dobbs Equipment
3.4% - Machinery Manufacturing. 50 Large 22,000 LB Double Drum Roller - 70" Case SV216D SV216D Trekker Tractor
3.4% - Machinery Manufacturing 50 Large 22,000 LB Double Drum Roller - 70" Caterpillar CB13 CB13 Kelly Tractor
3.4% - Machinery Manufacturing 50 Large 22,000 LB Double Drum Roller - 70" Caterpillar CB13 CB13 Ring Power
3.4% - Machinery Manufacturing 50 Large 22,000 LB Double Drum Roller - 70" Sakai SWS880 SW880 Great Southern Equipment
3.4% - Machinery Manufacturing 50 Large 22,000°L8 Double Drum Roller = 70" Volvo DD120C DD120C Cowin Equipment
3.4% - Machinery Manufacturing 50 Large 22,000 LB Double Drum Roller - 70" Volvo DD120C DD120C Flagler Construction Equipment
3.4% - Machinery Manufacturing 51 Trailer Mounted Sewer Cleaner Obrien 7018-5C 7018-5C Pat's Pumps
3.4% - Machinery Manufacturing 51 Trailer Mounted Sewer Cleaner? Sewer Equipment  |747-FR2000 747-FR2000 Sewer Equipment

. . Co. of America

3.4% - Machinery Manufacturing 51 Trailer Mounted Sewer Cleaner Vac-Con Vaclet V1700 Southern Sewer Equipment
3.4% - Machinery Manufacturing 51 Trailer Mounted Sewer Cleaner ] Vactor Ramlet 4018 Environmental Products
3.4% - Machinery Manufacturing 52 Trailer Mounted Vacuum Excavator, 14,000 LB GVWR RamVac Vacuum Excavator 1000 Sewer Equipment
3.4% - Machinery Manufacturing 52 Trailer Mounted Vacuum Excavator, 14,000 LB GVWR Vac-Con Mudslinger MS800 Southern Sewer Equipment
3.4% - Machinery Manufacturing 52 Trailer Mounted Vacuum Excavator, 14,000 LB GVWR Vermeer LP873SDT LP8735DT Vermeer Southeast
3.4% - Machinery Manufacturing 52 Trailer Mounted. Vacuum Excavator, 14,000 LB GVWR X-Vac X800 X800 Pat's Pumps
3.4% - Machinery Manufacturing 53 Combinaticn Sewer Cleaning/Vacuum Machine - 10 CUYD |Aquatech B-10 B-10 Pat's Pumps




FSA18-VEH16.0 Cab Chassis Trucks and Heavy Equipment
Contract Extension Rollover

3.4% - Machinery Manufacturing 53 Combination Sewer Cleaning/Vacuum Machine - 10 CUYD |Sewer Equipment |ECO-12YD Combo 900 Sewer Equipment
) ) Co. of America '
3.4% - Machinery Manufacturing 53 Combination Sewer Cleaning/Vacuum Machine - 10 CUYD |Vacall AIV1010 AV1010 Great Southern Equipment
3.4% - Machinery Manufacturing 53 Combination Sewer Cleaning/Vacuum Machine - 10 CUYD [Vac-Con 11 Yard 11 Yard Southern Sewer Equipment
3.4% - Machinery Manufacturing 53 Combination Sewer Cleaning/Vacuum Machine - 10 CUYD |Vactor 21001 Plus 2100l Plus Environmental Products
3.4% - Machinery Manufacturing 54 3-Wheel Mechanical or Regenerative Air Sweeper Elgin Pelican Elgin Pelican Elgin Pelican Environmental Products
3.4% - Machinery Manufacturing 54 3-Wheel Mechanical or Regenerative Air Sweeper Global R3 R3 Southern Sewer Equipment
3.4% - Machinery Manufacturing 54 3-Wheel Mechanical or Regenerative Air Sweeper Global M3 M3 Southern Sewer Equipment
3.4% - Machinery Manufacturing 55 Cabover Mechanical Broom Street Sweeper Elgin Eagle Eagle Environmental Products
3.4% - Machinery Manufacturing 55 Cabovar Mechanical Broom Street Sweeper Johnston E5351 |ES351 Pat's Pumps
3.4% - Machinery Manufacturing 55 Cabover Mechanical Broom Street Sweeper Schwarze M6 Avalanche M6 Avalanche Trekker Tractor [Reassignment)
3.4% - Machinery Manufacturing 56 Compact Air Sweeper- 2.3 CUYD Johnston €201 €201 Pat's Pumps
3.4% - Machinery Manufacturing 57 Regenerative Air Street Sweeper Elgin Crosswind J Plus Crosswind J Plus Environmental Products
3.4% - Machinery Manufacturing 57 Regenerative Air Street Sweeper Johnston RT655 RT655 Pat's Pumps
3.4% - Machinery Manufacturing 57 Regenerative Air Street Sweeper ) Schwarze A7 Tornado A7 Tornado Trekker Tractor (Redssignment)
3.4% - Machinery Manufacturing 58 Self-Propelled Hydrostatic Broom - Center Slung Blaw-Knox CB-85 CB-95 Cowin Equipment
3.4% - Machinery Manufacturing 58 Self-Propelled Hydrostatic Broom - Center Slung Broce 350 Broom 350 Broom Cowin Equipment
3.4% - Machinery Manufacturing 58 Self-Propelled Hydrostatic Broom - Center Slung Broce 350 Broom 350 Broom Kelly Tractor
5.9% - Truck Trailer 59 Enclosed Cargo.Trailer - 7,000 Lb GVWR, 7' X16' United U-716TA35-8.5 U-716TA35-8.5 Federal Contracts
5.9% - Truck Trailer 60 Deck Over Flatbed Trailer - 16,000 LB GYWR 8'6" X 25' Big Tex 22PH255 22PH255 Texas Trailars Sales and Service
5.9% - Truck Trailer 60 Deck Over Flatbed Trailer - 16,000 LB GVWR 8'6" X 25' Eager Beaver B3-DOW B3-DOW Dobbs Equipmeant
5.9% - Truck Trailer 60 Deck Over Flatbed Trailer - 16,000 LB GVWR 8'6" X 25' Econoline BPO821DE BPO821DE Deland Truck Center
5.9% - Truck Trailer 60 Deck Over Flatbed Trailer - 16,000 LB GVYWR 8'6" X 25' Felling Trailers FT-16-2 FT-16-2 Federal Contracts
5.9% - Truck Trailer 60 Deck Over Flatbed Trailer - 16,000 LB GYWR 8'6" X 25' Felling Trailers FT-16-2 FT-16-2 Kelly Tractor
5.9% - Truck Trailer 60 Deck Over Flatbed Trailer - 16,000'LB GVWR 8'6" X 25’ Interstate 16BST 16B5T Dobbs Equipment
5.9% - Truck Trailer 60 Deck Over Flatbed Trailer - 16,000 LB GVWR 8'6" X 25' Interstate 16BST 16BST Kelly Tractor
5.9% - Truck Trailer 60 Deck Over Flatbed Trailer - 16,000 LB GVWR 8'6" X 25 Texas Trailer TX85258T TX85258T Texas Trailers
5.9% - Truck Trailer 60 Deck Over Flatbed Trailer - 16,000 LB GVWR 8'6" X 25’ Towmaster TC-16 TC-16 Kelly Tractor
5.9% - Truck Trailer 60 Deck Over Flatbed Trailer - 16,000 LB GVWR 8'6" X 25" Towmaster TC-16 TC-16 Ring Power
5.9% - Truck Trailer 60 Deck Over Flatbed Trailer - 16,000 LB GVWR 8'6" X 25' Trail Xing TK20 TK20 Flagler Construction Equipment
5.9% - Truck Trailer - 61 Pull Behind Dump Trailer - 14,000 LB GVWR. Big Tex 141X 141X Texas Trailars
5:9% - Truck Trailer 62 Waste Trailer with Walking Floor - 48" Mac Trailer TNSP48MF TNSPASMF Trucks & Parts of Tampa
5.9% - Truck Trailer 62 Waste Trailer with Walking Floor - 48' Steco AW048102 AW048102 Deland Truck Center
5.9% - Truck Trailer 83 Hydraulic Tail Trailer - 70,000 LB Felling Trailers FT-70-2-PL-HT FT-70-2-PL-HT Federal Contracts
5.9% - Truck Trailer 63 Hydraulic Tail Trailer - 70,000 LB Felling Trailers FT-70-2-PL-HT FT-70-2-PL-HT Kelly Tractor
5.9% - Truck Trailer 63 Hydraulic Tail Trailer - 70,000 LB Pitts HD35 HD35 Deland Truck Center
3.4% - Machinery Manufacturing 64 Articulating Off Road Dump Truck - 50,000 LB Payload Bell B25E B25E Earthmovers
3.4% - Machinery Manufacturing 64 Articulating Off Road Dump Truck - 50,000 LB Payload Caterpillar 725 725 Kelly Tractor
3.4% - Machinery Manufacturing 64 Articulating Off Road Dump Truck - 50,000 LB Payload Caterpillar 725 725 Ring Power
3.4% - Machinery Manufacturing 64 Articulating Off Road Dump Truck - 50,000 LB Payload John Deere 260E 260E Dobbs Equipment
3.4% - Machinery Manufacturing 64 Articulating Off Road Dump Truck - 50,000 LB Payload Terex TA300 TA300 Trekker Tractor
3.4% - Machinery Manufacturing: 64 Articulating Off Road Dump Truck - 50,000 LB Payload Volvo A25G A256 Cowin Equipment
3.4% - Machinery Manufacturing 64 Articulating Off Road Dump Truck - 50,000 LB Payload Volvo A25G A25G Flagler Construction Equipment
3.4% - Machinery Manufacturing 65 Landfill Compactor - 80,000 LB Bomag BC772RB-4 BC772RB-4 Dobbs Equipment
3.4% - Machinery Manufacturing 65 Landfill Compactor - 80,000 LB Caterpillar 826 826 Kelly Tractor
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Name of Dealership
L

Trekker Tractor

Trekker Tractor

Trekker Tractor

Trekker Tractor

Ring Power Corporation

Ring Power Corporation

Ring Power Corporation

Kelly Tractor Co

Doosan

Doosan

Doosan

Doosan

Doosan '

Doosan

Type of Vehicle
EB ET - PARALLEL, ARM OPTI(

2019 Case 621G
2019 Case 621G
2019 Case 621G
2019 Case 621G
2019 Case 621G
2019 Case 621G
2019 Case 621G
2019 Case 621G

2019 Caterpillar 926 M
2019 Caterpillar 926 M
2019 Caterpillar 926 M
2019 Caterpillar 926 M
2019 Caterpillar 926 M
2019 Caterpillar 926 M
2019 Caterpillar 926 M
2019 Caterpillar 926 M

2019 Doosan DL220-5
2019 Doosan DL220-5
2019 Doosan DL220-5
2019 Doosan DL220-5
2019 Doosan DL220-5
2019 Doosan DL220-5
2019 Doosan DL220-5
2019 Doosan DL220-5

2019 Doosan DL280-3
2019 Doosan DL.280-5
2019 Doosan DL.280-3

Zone

ecificati

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern

Base Unit
Price

$134,566.00
-~ NB --
$128,159.00
—NB --
$128,159.00
—~NB -
$128,159.00
~NB -

$139,837.00
—~NB --
$139,837.00
-=NB --
$139,837.00
- NB --
$134,973.00
- NB -

$135,072.86
--NB --
$135,072.86
--NB --
$135,072.86
. -NB —
$135,072.86
«NB -

$158,489.00
--NB --
$158,489.00



Doosan

Doosan

Great Southern Equipment
Great Southern Equipment
Great Southern Equipment

Great Southern Equipment

Dobbs Equipment LLC
Dobbs Equipment LL.C
Dobbs Equipment LL.C

Dobbs Equipment LLC

Cowin Equipment
Flagler ConstructionEquipment
Flagler ConstructionEquipment

Flagler ConstructionEquipment

2019 Doosan DL280-5
2019 Doosan DL280-5
2019 Doosan DI.280-5
2019 Doosan DL280-5
2019 Doosan DL280-5

2019 Hitachi ZW180
2019 Hitachi ZW180
2019 Hitachi ZW180
2019 Hitachi ZW180
2019 Hitachi ZW180
2019 Hitachi ZW180
2019 Hitachi ZW180
2019 Hitachi ZW180

2019 John Deere 5241,
2019 John Deere 5241
2019 John Deere 524L
2019 John Deere 524L
2019 John Deere 524L
2019 John Deere 524L
2019 John Deere 524L
2019 John Deere 524L

2019 Volvo L60H
2019 Volvo L60H
2019 Volvo L60H
2019 Volvo L60H
2019 Volvo L60H
2019 Volvo L60H
2019 Volvo L60H
2019 Volvo L60H

Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central

Central

Southern

Southern

* Western
Western
*Northern
Northern

% Central
Central

* Southern

Southern

--NB --
$158,489.00
--NB --
$158,489.00
--NB --

$149,225.00
—~NB -
$149,225.00
--NB --
$149,225.00
--NB --
$149,225.00
- NB --

$124,585.00
--NB --
$124,585.00
o NB -~
$124,585.00
- NB --
$124,585.00
—-NB -

$119,479.00
--NB --
$120,000.00
—-NB --
$120,000.00
~NB -
$120,000.00
~-NB -
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3.0 CU YD WHEEL LOADER (Z-BAR LINKAGE BUCKET - PARALLEL ARM
OPTION)
SPECIFICATION #33

2019 Caterpillar 926 M ‘

The Caterpillar 926 M purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equiprhent as specified by the manufacturer for
this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract’s vehicle base
price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $139,837.00 $139,837.00 $139,837.00 $134,973.00

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency, In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs. '

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in-approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order,

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the approliriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however; those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.



VEHICLE: 926 M
DEALER: Ring Power Corporation Ring Power Corporation Ring Power :Corporation Kelly Tractor Co
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $139,837.00 $139,837.00 $139,837.00 $134,973.00
Western
& Northern
Order Code  Delete Optror1§_ e e & Centra_l“_“_l Southern
l457-1483 P+ I'Downgrade, model-+ specify - - ' ($39 711, 00) ($39,2164.00)2
9182 . '..'| DOWNGRADE 10 918M, BASEMCHINEONLYI . oL
I . v BASE 918 WHEEL LOADER W/FREIGHT& PREP ONLY 2. ) . ! K
Downgrade model spe-elfy
L R Downgrade model = specify + ‘ 7 A 7 . ,,
Downgrade medel - specrfy
L' I Delefe caband A/C - - NA NA
Opttonal equrpment delete spec:fy N
L - Optronal equipment d delete specrfy ; ' :
Optional equipment delete specify
Waestern
& Northern
Order Code Add Optlons e & Central _ Southern ~
E: C Upgrade to mlmmum 180 hp 4. 0 cu yd wheel _loader wrth/23' §R25 ED_»radml&tlres . ) I\EA S
430-2806 | Model upgrade - specrfy $842.00" (81, 914 00)
930 2 UPGRADE TO 930M, BASE MACHINE ONLY. |
BASE 930 WHEEL LOADER W/FREIGHT & PREP ONLY 2
4363807 U7 [Model upgrade 2specify - - .- .- T T TV T e, Eio 00l 7 $17,728.00°
938 " ' |UPGRADETO 938M, BASEMACHINEONLYI R R
l“ s L BASE 938 WHEEL LOADER W/FREIGHT & PREP ONLY 2 ) Lol
468- 0900 ™" 'Model upgrade - specify o ] $55,387.00" ‘
UPGRADE TO 95 0GC, BASE MACHINE ONLY 1
W:QQBOO P I Madel upgrade specify .- SO B B $96,472:00" | T
fo- . |UPGRADETO 950M BASE MACHINE, ONLYl L S &
4642610 | Model upgrade - specify B S | $110,376.00" l
UPGRADE TO 962M, BASE MACHINE ONLY |
f361 1910 o L ;| Model upgrade - specify T S "$_ll38 840‘6(_) N
b UPGRADE TO 966M, BASE MACHINE, ONLY 1 e
357-'8361“‘" s Radml L res T T 'sh ferris ”s’i?féﬁﬂ
522-9071 2 TIRES, 20.5R25 BS VT * L3 1
TIRES, 20.5R25 TL BRAWLER, SM 2
4302823 1 Thll‘d “spool valve/control lever . RN R _-"$‘1,‘7,57.0'_0']" N
RETEER HYD3VC0UPLERREADYSTDL]FT1 s i N ot ] -
Manual quick hitch couplerysywstern- . ~ NA
430-29'77"’“l Hydraulic quick:hitch coupler system N e J "$-2‘;752.()041 |+ $2,815.00°
430_2977 QUICK COUPLER, FUSION 1, E - o CL .
yo |evrex COUPLER, FUSIONZ Va - Sl




$1,581.00%]

$632 00

[ER T SV E——— -..J. d

$2 003.00°

. "$2,297.007

b e e -.

$7,081. 00*

] R e e e

2

i

" $5.976.00%

$772 002

CAB, DELUXE 2

$1,651.00%

1 $2,546.00°

$1,980.00%

VEHICLE: 926 M
1
DEALER: . Ring Power Corporation Ring Power Corporation Ring Power Corporation Kelly Tractor Co
ZONE: Western Northern Central
BASE PRICE: $139,837.00 $139,837.00 $139,837.00
423-7201 ' | Airride seat
423-7202 2 | SEAT, DELUXE !
SEAT, PREMIUM 2
'353“1369 ”.. AM/FM weatlier bandradio . -~ - . T
333- 1369 -| R4DI10, €D, DELUXE | .
, RADIO €D; DELUYE 2
Parallel arm "TooI Carrler system
R 1T S e
333-6526 | | Limited slip
333-6526 > | DIFFERENTIAL, LIMITED SLIP REAR |
DIFFERENTIAL, LIMITED SLIP REAR 2
i362- 0563_] | Multi-purpose’ attachments specify T X
1360~ 3300 BUCKET-NP, 2.7 ¥D3 .
[ ARM, MATERIAL- HANDLING 2
345-—2750 2 Multl-purpose attachlnen_ts . si)ecll‘y o S
FORK, 72" CONSTRUCTION 2
[T [Multi-purpose attachments - specify - .. 5o
Multi-purpose attachments specify
i ' Multi-'purpose attacllrhents - specify | ‘
430-2865 | Optional equipment - specxfy
25% ENVIRONMENT, MEDIUM DEBRIS |
DISCOUNT 2 | 25% DISCOUNT OFF LIST PRICE ON CAT WHEEL LOADER MODELS 918,926 & 938. 27%
DISCOUNT ON MODEL 930. 16% DISCOUNT ON CAT WORK TOOLS.2
f430 2875 » Optlonal equipment - speclfy T T
l430-2823 ) ENV]RONMENT HIGH DEBRIS 1 ‘ )
! ... | H¥D, 3V, COUPLER READY STDLIF:TZ g el
1. ___“_u; SR DU L VU e et s ham i s v e a D
521-3601 ! Optional equ1pment speclfy
430-2853 2 | UPGRADE TO 926M DCAI |
HYD, 3V, COUPLER READY, HIGH LIFT 2
(521-3602 || Optional equipment - specify : . - - o
‘430_2997 UPGRADE TO 926MBCA2 1. . .
{ STEERHVG STANDARD DUAL MODE * 2
521——3603 Optional equipment - specrfy S
430-2865 2 | UPGRADE TO 926M DCA3
ENVIRONMENT, MEDIUM DEBRIS 2
52_1-‘32'44'1‘- (l)p'tional‘eqm?ment éi)‘e;&y D
430-2875 * ' [ CAB, DELUXE y
T B ENVIRONMENT HIGH DEBRIS2 o .
488-1113 ! Optlonal equipment - sPec1fy T
521-3244 2 | LIGHTS, AUX HALOGEN




VEHICLE:

9_26 M ‘
DEALER: Ring Power Corporation Ring Power Corporation Ring Power Corporation Kelly Tractor Co
ZONE: " Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $139,837.00 $139,837.00 $139,837.00 $134,973.00
[ass-1114 " Optional e equlpment speczfy AN ””—73566'2”6"6‘ ’”"'“"55"7'6"2“66
i423 7301 21| LIGHTS, AUXLED . L o
e %SEAT DELUXE2 ’ r"u R . . 3 s E
366- 6911 Optlonal equ1pment specify $27 620 00 $652 002 '
494-7970 2 | TIRES, 60.5X10.5X21 FLEX SMOOTH |
’ LIGHTS, AUX LED PREMIUM 2
430-2859 a ‘Optional equlpment spemfy R ,~__:T:-11— . . T ”_7153-652 00 . ,$2,36’6.0Q2‘
467—7988 R—’DECONTROL B : R
\ ‘ ‘_- COUNTERWEIGHT JLOGGER/AGG2 . e AR LN R TL - .
[ 2 o e e e T et 7 it e i e 2 e it 2 PG . 4 e i
377~5635 Optlonal eqmpment specify $702.001 $2,652. 002
430-28 59 CAMERA, REAR VIEW |
RIDE CONTROL 2
3“49"'8165 ~ | Optional equipment - Eﬁé&f}' RS B 73'91’5‘@"{' "73“1""6'55 '0"6
1377. 5635 | GUARD; POWERTRAIN, LOWER 1™ =~ " v L L v I R
R ,.CAMERAREARVIEW2 ST T ; .
4251425 7| Optional equipment - speciy ) $356.000 $2 306,007
377-5660 2 | GUARD, POWERTRAIN, SIDE .1
DETECTION, OBJECT (RADAR 2
349 8163 l- L tlonale uj| ment s yeci] R _ﬂ S ) _ . - $629.00% ;’T.\" $?1‘74.OO;2{
333: 1425 i\ | GUARD; CRANKCA S DT - E y R
Lo WARNING BEAC'ON LED STROBE 2 e, b v A C T
DISCOUNT 0 t10nale uipment - § eci ! $4,‘319.002
p quip P
454-5890 2 | 25% DISCOUNT OFF OF 926M & 918M; 26% DISCOUNT OFF OF 930M: 27% DISCOUNT OFF OF J
938M: 21% DISCOUNT OFF OF 950GC; 18% DISCOUNT OFF OF 950M & 962M: 22% DISCOUNT
OFF OF 966M. DISCOUNTS APPLY TO ALL OEM NON-SPECIFIED OPTIONS. 16% DISCOUNT ON
ALL CAT WORK TOOLS!
AUTOLUBE 2
f*_ o Temporaty tag-- a s R SN ‘«
Transfer existing reglstratlon (must provnde tag numbex) : :
2 Ef.. New “state tag(specify state, county, c1ty, sheriff, etc) R o 2t LT,
SERVICE !~ |Maintenance Plan - specify : ! $6 621. 00
3YR/3000HR | PREVENTATIVE MAINTENANCE CONTRACTS ARE AVAILABLE. TOTAL MAINTENANCE AND
PM PKG 2 REPAIR CONTRACTS ARE AVAILABLE. |
| PREVENTATIVE MAINTENANCE FOR 3 YRS OR 3000 HRS AT 500 HR OR 6 MONTH INTERVALS,
PKGINCLUDES 6 TOTAL PAS2
5YR/5000HR ‘Maintenance Plan - specify. -, &, - N S by R 3‘1 $11 729.00>
B PKG PREVENTATIVE MAINTENANCE.FOR 5 YRS, OR 5000 HRSATSOG HR OR 6MONTH E\ITERVALS. o .
i . PKGINCLUDESJO TOTALPM‘Sl Pl w1 N
- s Sen 33 R PSRN T S N SV ""-_J;‘,':-""'"'I";'" ity
Warranty - specify $3,614.001
3 YEAR/ 5,000 HOUR PREMIER. PREMIER WARRANTY IS AVAILABLE FOR ALL UPGRADED AND
DOWNGRADED MACHINES, |
T Warra;l—t;_'speclfy e A TR Er “ : $2 593 00 : . -
o S YEAR Y7, 500:HQUR: POWERTRAIN POWERTM!N WARRANTYISAVAILABLEFORALL ‘ ] e
‘ K UPGRADEDANDDOWWGRADEDMCHINES : Cowt T B ", o
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3.0 CU YD WHEEL LOADER (Z-BAR LINKAGE BUCKET - PARALLEL ARM
OPTION) .
SPECIFICATION #33

2019 Caterpillar 926 M

(Alternate Dealer Option)

The Caterpillar 926 M purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for
this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract’s vehicle base
price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -~ No bid -~ -- No bid -- -~ No bid -- -- No bid -~

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order. -

‘NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.



VEHICLE:
DEALER:
ZONE:

BASE PRICE:

Order Code ’

926 M (ALTERNATE DEALERS)

Northern
- NO bid -

Southern
--No bid --

Central
. == No bid --

Western
--No bid --

Delete Options

|
{ . LA S

L E -

- | Downgrade mdde] - specify- -

All Zones

1 Downgxade model = specify -

Downglade model - specify

B B e A A R sy

Downgrade model - specify

|Belete caband AC T T T

.

Optional equipment delete - specify

Y [P N S

Optlonal equipment’ delete speclfy

Kon e mn oot e ima

Optional equipment delete - specify

Add Optlons

i y Upglade 10 mlmml}m 189 hp 4. 0 cu. yd wheel loader w1th/23 SR25 LQ radial tlres o . |- J“ L
| Model upgrade - specqlf; T e , B
T el apade sy TS T [ T S e e e
' Model upgrade - specify T o o
IL B "_l\ilo_‘dei:lj‘pg_rade"’;.isiaee‘ify_: SR ‘{-‘ . __ - ':" —"——“ ‘ ]
Model upgrade - specify A
o [Modébuplrade sspecify. T - i T T e L
20.5R25 Radial L3 tires ‘
L T [ThindspoolvalvefGonollever - Tk T T e T e T

Manual quick hitch coupler system .

‘r— ' Hydgalilic quick hitch coup}er.,éystem T Mﬂ . "":.I.,Z . s e T
Air ride seat : '
(e JAMRM weatherband silio - e A T
i Parallcl arm "Tool Camer system o - ) )
§ No Sﬁlﬁ ‘ " | .- 1"‘3- R i : T e
Limited shp _
', SRR ;Multlepurpqse'ét{dcﬁﬁient‘s f-'ﬁ‘sffé(':‘ify s R = T . o _ T .
. - Multi-purpose attachments - specify T
PR [Multi-purposd attachments - specify - % o
Multi-purpose attachn:e—nts siaecify o o
{"; 7 |Multi-purpose attachmients~ specxfy-':‘ R , Lo .:'.?f:: - *; B )
T 6;{1&1—{1 equipment - specify N o
[ ovixs . Optiorial'equipment = specify:. N

OptiOnal equipment specify - .

»»»»»




BASE PRICE:

VEHICLE:

DEALER:
ZONE:

926 M (ALTERNATE DEALERS)

Central
-~ No bid --

Northern
--No bid --

Westerx_l
-~ No bid --

Southern

- No bid -

Optlonal equipment - specify
Opt10nalezqwlni;rr"lél;tm;};c;fym‘:“:_‘ ST P ST, - . - ) = M“ ©
E)ptlénal equipment - sp‘;e;xf; T I
% 1o Optlonal equipmefit.; sB&Tf} T ey N R
Optlonal equipment - spe_mfy i T
. {Optional equipinent - sptcify AR R
Optional equipment - specify -
T Gl sapment gy T TR TR T TR e ey
Optional equipment - specify )
T "" Option”al‘éciuipmeﬁti-speéify. Pane i . -
: Optional equ1pment speclfy S
Lo o fTemporayag .t TR T T LR Ik SR
‘ T Transfer ex1stmg regIStratlon (must prov1de tag n{in;gél)ﬂ“hwmmhd T I
T N it g spesify state, ey, Sy SR S T TR
o o Maintenance Plan - spemfy __‘_u N
r . 'Mamtenance PTzIrT specxfy - 'w‘.-_ !— o __w:.‘__-_._ ____ - : B
Warranty spec1fy S . -
[T ettty T T T e T T R




