RESOLUTIONNO, 201932

A RESOLUTION BY THE BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS OF ST. JOHNS COUNTY,
FLORIDA, AUTHORIZING THE COUNTY ADMINISTRATOR, OR DESIGNEE, TO PURCHASE
AND TO EXECUTE A PURCHASE ORDER FOR ONE (1) NEW CAPTERPILLAR 926M WHEEL
LOADER FOR THE SOLID WASTE DIVISION

RECITALS

WHEREAS, the County seeks to purchase one (1) New Caterpillar 926M Wheel Loader for the Solid
Waste Division; and .

WHEREAS in accordance with section 302.6.5.4 of the St. Johns Countyl Purchasing Manual, entitled
"Piggyback or Cooperative Purchasing”, the County is authorized make said purchase subject to the terms
.and conditions of Florlda Sheriff’s Association Contract #F SA18-VEH16.0 ("Contract™); and

WHEREAS, purchase of the equipment will be funded by the Solid Waste Division; and

WHEREAS, the County has reviewed the terms, prm)isions, conditions and requirements of the
Contract and finds that entering into the Contract for purchase of the loader serves a public purpose.

NOW, THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED BY THE BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
OF ST. JOHNS COUNTY, FLORIDA, as follows:

Section 1."The above Recitals are incorporated by reference into the body of this Resolution and such
Recitals are adopted as finds of fact. '

Section 2. The County Administrator, or designee, is hereby authorized to purchase one (1) New
Caterpillar 926M Wheel Loader.

Section 3. In accordance with the terms and conditions of the Contract, ti]e County Administrator, or
designee, is further authorized to execute a purchase order in the amount of $196,156.00 for the purchase of
‘one (1) New Caterpillar 926M Wheel Loader from Ring Power Corporation.

Section 4. To the extent that there are typographical and/or admmlstratlveverrors that do not change the
tone, tenor, or concept of this Resolution, then this Resolution may be revised ‘without subsequent approval
by the Board of County Commlssmners

PASSED ND ADOPTED by the Board of County Commissioners of St. Johns County, Florida, this
/4% day of 2019.
BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS OF

ST. JOHNS COUNTY, FLORIDA
By %7(/ /% ///fggkh'\
~ATTEST: Huntey S. Conrad, Clerk.
By: ’7Qm %LH:«M«. : |
Deputy Clerk RENDITION DATE <2/21 // 9 ST

Paul M. Waldron, Chair
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lProtectIng, Lead.-ng & Uniting..:Since:1893

-'FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION

261 7 Mahan Drlve, Ta]lahassee, Florida 32308 ! P (850) 87742165
P 0 Box 12519 Tallahassee, Florlda 32317- 2519 f:

WWW ﬂshenffs org ;

Date:  October 1,2018
To: All I5erspective Participants

From: Steve Casey, Executive Director ,
Sarrah Glassner, Deputy Exécutive Directar
Annette Grissom, CPP Manager. -
Lisa Gregor, CPP Coordinator

Re: Contract Number FSA18-VEH16.0 Cabs & Chassis Trucks and Heavy Equipment

We are pleased to announce that the Florida Sheriffs " Association Cobpera’li_ve Purchasing Program has
successfully completed its 16th nationwide cooperative bid for heavy duty trucks and equipment. This contract is
in effect beginning October 1, 2018 through September 30, 2019.

This \}ear’s bid includes 83 specifications‘ and 356 makes and models. It offers cab and chassis trucks, loaders,
bulldozers, lawn mowers, generators and much more.

The competitive process for this award-began in February 2018, when stakeholders were surveyed regarding
procurement needs. Specifications were deveioped based on prior year activity and new additions were added.
based on survey results and the Fleet Advisory Committee’s review of commodities.

On Mav 8, 2018, a direct notification was sent to 521 prospective bidders to register for quallflcatlon to participate
in the bid process. An advertisement of the Invitation to Bid was placed within the Florida Administrative Weekly
on May 14, 2018 and again on' May 29, 2018. From this ITB, 121 bidders responded to the pre-bid meeting
registration. Of these respondents, 86 submitted bids and 81 qualified, responsive bidders were awarded after a
review by the FSA Fleet Advisory Committee.

The Florida Sheriffs Association Cooperative Purchasing Program has followed the Contract Terms and Conditions
to procure this contract. '

Contract prices are gxtended" and guaranteed to any local government or political subdivision of the state, public
educational institutions, other public agencies or authorities with the State of Florida, and entities.approved by
the manufacturer to participate in this contract.

Qut of state sales are permitted under this contract. All purchasers are bound by their local governing purchasing
ordinances, rules and regulations.

All awarded vendors are governed by their manufacturer agreements and the Contract Terms and Conditions.



List of Awards for FSA18-VEH16.0 Cabs & Chassis Trucks and Heavy Equipment:

ACF Standby Systems LLC

Alamo Industrial

Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac
Alan Jay Chrysler Jeep Dodge of Wauchula

Alan Jay Ford Lincoln

ARS Powersports

AutoNation CDIR Pembroke Pines.
Bandit Ihdustries, Inc. .

Bay Dodge Chrysler Jeep Ram
Bobcat Company

Bozard Ford .

Broyhﬂl Manuféduring Company
Choo Choo Lawn Equipment
Coggin Ford

Container Systems & Equipment
Cowin Equipment

Creel Tractor

Cub Cadet

Deland Truck Center

Dobbs Equipment LLC

Doosan- :

Duval Ford

Ea¢hmovers Construction Equipment, LLC
Environmental Products of Florida
Everglades-Equipment Group
Federal Contracts Corp

Flagler Construction Equipment
Four Star Freightliner

Futch's Tractor Depot

Garber Chrysler

Garber Ford

General GMC

GHC Motorsports

Godwin Pumps of America

Great Southern Equipment

Hale Trailer Brake & Wheel, Inc
Holland Isump Company
Humdinger Equipment

Isuzu Truck of Ocala

IT-S

Jef‘frey"A!Ien, Inc.

Kelly Tractor Co

. Kenworth of Central Florida !
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Kenworth of Jacksonville
Kenworth of South Florida
LJ Power |
Lou Bachrodt Freightliner
Maudlin International Trucks
Menzi USA Sales, Inc. .

Mid Florida Diesel, Inc

Morbark LLC

Nextran

Orlando Freightliner

Palm Truck Center

Palmetto Truck Center

Pantropic Power

Pat's Pump & Blower

Rechtien International Trucks, Inc.
Ridge Equipment Co., Inc.

Ring Power Corporation

Rush Truck Center - Tampa

Sarasota Fun Machines

Sewer Equipment

Southern Sewer Equipment Sales
Southern States Toyotalift
Southport Truck Group

Stingray Chevrolet LLC

Sun State International Trucks, LLC
Terrain King ‘
Texas. Trailers Sales and Service

_Thompéon Pump, Inc.

Tradewinds Power

Trekker Tractor

Truckmax Isuzu

Truckmayx, Inc

Trucks & Parts of Tampa, LLC
United Rentals (North America), Inc.
Ventrac

Vermeer Southeast

Weedoo

Zabatt,
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3.0 CU YD WHEEL LOADER (Z-BAR LINKAGE BUCKET - PARALLEL ARM
OPTION)
SPECIFICATION #33

2019 Caterpillar 926 M
i
The Caterpillar 926 M purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipmerit as specified by the manufacturer for
this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base
price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: . Western . Northern Central . Southern
BASE PRICE:" $139,837.00 $139,837.00 $)1"39,837.00 $134,973.00 .

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and _Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to

* vary from agency to agency, In an effort to incorporate flexibility into,our program, we havecreated specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to-tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs

The following equipment delete and add options.and their related cost are provided here to a3sist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here-may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prlces .



VEHICLE:

926 M ‘

DEALER: Ring Power Corporation Ring Power Corporation Ring Power Corporation Kelly Tractor Co
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southemn ‘
BASE PRICE: $139,837.00 $139,837.00 .$139,837.00 $134,973.00
Western
. & Northern
Order Code Delete Options ] . . & Central Southern L
{457-1488 ¥ .*| Downgrade-model - specify - - e e D [(939,711.00)! ] (839,464.00)°
9182 . - |DOWNGRADETO9I8M, BASEAMCH]NEGNLYI : o R ot
S W | BasE9Is WHEELLOADER W/FREIGHT&PREP ONLY 2 . "
Downgrade model - speclfy
{q_ .. .| Downgrade mode] - specify : - - e i
Downgrade model specrfy
EL_ ' ., | Delete cab and A/C ) , " NA - NA
. Optional equipment delete - specxfy
L Optlonal equlpment delete - speclfy - B B ’
Optional equipment delete - specify
Western
& Northern
Order Code Add Optrons & Central _ Southern
i¥ ' :;'. Upgrade to mlmmum 180 hp 4.0 cus yd wheel. Ioader with/23. 5R25°1LD. radlal tires | - NA : . _ e
430-2806 | [ Mode! upgrade - specify $842.00" | ($1,914.00)] -
030 2 UPGRADE TO 930M, BASE MACHINE ONLY 1 '
BASE 930 WHEEL LOADER W/FREIGHT & PREP ONLY Z ‘
430- 2807 ““I'Model upgrade: specrfy . | $22,820:00" |- $17?;_728;_()02
938 UPGRADE TO933M, BASEAMCHINEONLYI LR ST | R
t BASE938 WHEELLOADER W/FREIGHT&PREPONLY2 o - o A .
468.0900 " | Model upgrade - specify $55,387.00!
UPGRADE T 950GC, BASE MACHINE ONLY
464-2600 L. I'Model upgrade - specify . ; oo - 396;422.091
- | UPGRADETO 9500, BASEMACHINEONLYI O PP BERE R
464-2610 Model upgrade - specrfy $110,376.00l
UPGRADE TO 962M, BASE MACHINE ONLY
33?19101 1 Model: upgrade specrfy ‘ ) *m Lt -T-,TW T 2 $'18'8,'840.__00l o 1
UPGRADE TO 966, BASEWCHINEONLYI : L S N
357-8901 | | 20.5R25 Radial L3 fires . $11,134.00' | $28,199.00%
522-9071 2 TIRES, 20.5R25 BSVJT *L3 1
TIRES, 20.5R25 TL BRAWLER, SM 2 ‘
430-'2823,l <* | Third spool valve/controllever ;' S e 1#...:_: s m,§1,757 001, -
- HYD3VCOUPLERREADYSTDLIFT1 R P ER )
Manual qurck hitch coupler system T “NA .
430- 2977 Hydraulic quick hitch coupler system R ST T 752,000 | 252,815,007
430_2977 QUICK COUPLER, FUSION w0 L . eoE e S <o
. _ QUICKCOUPLER FUS10N2 | R PP B | .
(RIS LN e Breian s L S U '1,_ - N




VEHICLE:

|
|
|
|

926 M
|

DEALER: Ring Power Corporation Ring Power Corporation Ring Power Corporation Kelly Tractor Co
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $139,837.00 $139,837.00 $139,837.00 $134,973.00
423-7201 | Air ride seat $702.00' | $1,581.007
423-7202 2 | SEAT, DELUXE !
SEAT, PREMIUM ?
333-1369 | .| AM/FM weather band radio ; .$632.00' | . $632.00°
33321369 2 {RADIO, CD,DELUXE'l -+, R A o e N
s e | RaproiCD, DEL.UXEZ S T L L
"Parallel arm "Tool Carner system. NA
© T | Nospinn ) T e Tk UONALS y
333-6526 | | Limited slip : $2,003.00" | $2,003.00%
333-6526 2° | DIFFERENTIAL, LIMITED SLIP REAR '}
| DIFFERENTIAL, LIMITED SLIP REAR 2 ,
362-0902 [ Multi-purpose’ attachments - 5pec1fy R | -$18,708.00%  $2,297.00%
360-3300 2 BUCKET-MP, 2.7 YD3 : T . . R
I ARM AMTERIALHANDLINGZ , , e
34527502 | Multi-purpose attachments - speclfy $7,081.00°
: "FORK, 72" CONSTRUCTION 2
L | Multi-purpose attachments - specify’ - - B RS :
Multi-purpose attachments - specify T
!';x S | Multi:purpose aftﬁchmen'ts—‘—”s;;ecify".’_i,": L 5o R s -
430-2865 ! Optional equipmerit - specify $1,651.001 2
25% ENVIRONMENT, MEDIUM DEBRIS |,
DISCOUNT 2 | 25% DISCOUNT OFF LIST PRICE ON CAT WHEEL LOADER MODELS 918,926 & 938. 27%
- " | DISCOUNT ON MODEL 930. 16% DISCOUNT ON CAT WORK TOOLS.2
[430—2875 ~Optlonal equipment - spec1fy o = m$§ 54%601 ""5355’;'“6"02
';430-2823 2, | ENVIRONMENT, HIGH DEBRIS 1 e . o Cae _
i | HID, 37, COUPLERREADYSTDL]FT2 S R PR -
5213601 ! Optional eqquEEm specify B 31187, o0l | $5.976.00°
430-2853 2 | UPGRADE TO 926M DCAI 1
HYD, 3V, COUPLER READY, HIGH LIFT 2
521-3602° . |'Optional equipment - specify - o Ces T T “$15,014,00" | - .$772.00°
430-29972 |UPGRADETQ926MDCA2: 1 "~ = 0. e e o s LT T
; 0 - | sTEERIVG, STANDARD_D(}JALMODE‘{Z L B
521-3603 |- | Optional equipment - specify $21,450.00' |  $1,651. 002
430-2865 2 | UPGRADE TO 926M DCA3 1
ENVIRONMENT, MEDIUMDEBRIS' 2 , ,
521-3244 L | Optional eqm]i)ment specxfy e $1,980.00" |, $2;546.007] -
430-2875 2 | CAB; DELUXE R P R L R
ENV]RONMENT HIGHDEBRJSZ. U T S, ) S e
488-1113 1 Optlonal eqmpment-sPemfy i $258.00' |  $1,980.00
521-3244 2 | LIGHTS, AUX HALOGEN
. CAB, DELUXE 2




| 5 YEAR/ 7,500 HOUR POWERTRAHV POWERTRAII\T WARRANTYISAVAILABLE FORALL
. UPGRADED AND DO WNGRADED MACHINES - S ;

VEHICLE: 926 M
DEALER: Ring Power Corporation Ring Power Corporation Ring Power Corporation Kelly Tractor Co
ZONE? Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $139,837.00 $139,837.00 $139,837.00 $134,973.00
488- 11141 _ | optional equipmert = spemfy LT R + $602.00" | $702:00%
423- 7201 * | LIGHTS, AUXLED ¥, Coa S T : S
) , SEAT DELUXE‘ 2" ) RO R
366-6911 i Optlonal equlpment speclfy $27,620.00l $652.00*
494-7970 % | TIRES, 60.5X10.5X21 FLEX SMOOTH |
LIGHTS, AUX LED PREMIUM 2
430: 2859 E -Opnonal eqmpment spemfy W ‘ 1 $25652.00" 1 $2,306.00°
467—7988 RIDECONTROL N P T P N " o -
COUNTERWEIGHT LOGGER/AGG 2 PO e e Ty S
377-5635 Opt:onal equnpment specify ) $702. 66 a $2‘;652.002
430-2859 2 | CAMERA, REAR VIEW 1
| RIDE CONTROL 2
349- -8165 ! Optional equipment = spec1fy B e R R - $915.:.0_6TI_‘ $1,=055./(j()\2
377 5635 2 | |GUARD, POWERTRAIN LOWER'L - = 7 . .7 o - w .
; ‘ CAMERA REAR VIEW2 " Lo o Lo )
425- 1425 Optlonal equnpment spec1fy $356.00" $2,306.002
377.5660 2 | GUARD, POWERTRAIN, SIDE |
) DETECTION, OBJECT (RADAR 2 '
349-8163 1+ - Optional eqmpment spec1fy T '$‘629.,001'.,' 7 $174.00%
333-1425 2., GUARD CRANKCASE' 1 R v oL ST ’
RN WARNING, BEACON, LEDSTROBE2 _ L
-DISCOUNT i Optlonal equipiment - specify ! $4,319.00%
454-5800 2 | 25% DISCOUNT OFF OF 926M & 918M: 26% DISCOUNT OFF OF 930M: 27% DISCOUNT OFF OF
938M;: 21% DISCOUNT OFF OF 950GC; 18% DISCOUNT OFF OF 950M & 962M: 22% DISCOUNT
OFF OF 966M. DISCOUNTS APPLY TO ALL OEM NON-SPECIFIED OPTIONS 16% DISCOUNT ON
ALL CAT WORK TOOLS! .
AUTOLUBE 2
L Terriporalj( tag, e ; L - . IR iﬁ C “_-i-_‘,,sm_v ___:—: Tr . = -
Transfer existing reglstratlon (must provide tag number) ‘

'; iy o New state tag (spec1fy state, county, city, sheriff; etc) ’ B NN L
SERVICE ! Maintenance Plan - specify ' _1 ) $6,621.002
IYR/3000HR | PREVENTATIVE MAINTENANCE CONTRACTS ARE AVAILABLE. TOTAL MAINTENANCE AND -

PMPKG 2 | REPAIR CONTRACTS ARE AVAILABLE. 1
PREVENTATIVE MAINTENANCE FOR 3 YRS OR 3000 HRS AT 500 HR OR 6MONTHINTERVALS
PKGINCLUDES 6 TOTAL PM'S2

. ;SYR/SOOOHR Mairitenance Plan - specify” : T : '7 $11;729.00%
}PM PKG PREVENTATIVE MAINTENANCE FOR 5 YRS OR 5000 HRSAT500 HR OR 6 MONTH INTERVAIS o, .
N “PKG INCLUDES 10 TOTAL PM5'2 . R

" | Warranty - speclfy $3,614.00"
3 YEAR /5,000 HOUR PREMIER. "PREMIER WARRANTY IS AVAILABLE FOR ALL UPGRADED AND
DOWNGRADED MACHINES. |
T Wammanty Sspecify L LTI R § 2,593.00

[
|
|
\
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3.0 CU YD WHEEL LOADER (Z-BAR LINKAGE BUCKET - PARALLEL ARM
OPTION)
SPECIFICATION #33

2019 Caterpillar 926 M
(Alternate Dealer Option).

¢

The Caterpillar 926 M purchased through this contract comes w1th all the standard- eqlllpment as specified by the manufacturer for
this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base
price as awarded by specification by zone,

Ky

ZONE: Western ~ Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: - Nobid-- -- No bid -- ~ --Nobid~ -- No bid -

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment néeds and preferences are going to
vary from agency to dgency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to a551st you in approximating the total cost

of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the followmg equipment items you

wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to detefmine the
_approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete opticns and their prices should bé obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.



VEHICLE:

DEALER:
ZONE:

BASE PRICE:

Western
-- No bid --

926 M (ALTERNATE DEALERS)

Northern
-- No bid -

Central
--No bidl -=

Southern
-- No bid --

Order Code  "Delete Options e ) ' All Zones

f c o ‘Downgrade model - specify i c ~_~ ' I J o s
Downgrade model - specify D ! T

[ |Downgrade model -specify : . - . B
Downgrade model - specify : T

{-. - . |Deletecaband A/C - :
Optional equipment delete - specify

5{_‘,& :Optional ggu_ip'mept deleté‘-:spccify.'a,..' s Lo R « i“ : N
Optional equipment delete - specify '

Order Code  Add Options o L - __All Zones

iL 77 "+ Upgrade to minimum‘180 hp 4,0 cu. yd. whéeﬁo%gériyitﬁ]ﬁ.SRZSﬂ ‘LD'rgdiail;,tir_gi 7 . _' ’
Model upgrade - specify

| 7.7 : |Model upgrade - specify: . o AR S
Model upgrade - specify - | I

} o 7 |Modeélupgrade - specify - < . .. . - - 1:'-.“ -
Model upgrade - specify -

N L S KRN e

| " |20.5R25 Radial L3 fires -

}E L Third spool {.{al,'ve/conn:d‘lfleyem;#i—-:‘." - : S ,.”.:_ o
Manual quick hitch coupler system B E

(oo |Hydrhulic quick hite copler system " . T T S
Air ride seat . . :

T T AN weather band radio . - - R AR

g Parallel’arm "Tool Carrier" system

[ oo Nespin i T TP
‘Limited slip - N . o

[ | Multi-purpose attachrhents - $i3ééify e _ o
Multi-purpose attachments - specify .

_ l o #| Multi-purpose attachments - specify N R 1.
. Multi-purpose attachments - specify . , ' T
(#mj . Mulfi-purpose attachments.- specify ' * - ’ T R
. Optional equipment - specify , )

[ ... .. |Optional cquipmerit - specify .~ .~ - i I A S
Optional eqliipment - specify ll _

E = Jthib”'nalr‘-'éQuipm,e'n\t * specify’ " v _ e - _M— {i R . - .




VEHICLE:
DEALER:

ZONE:

926 M (ALTERNATE DEALERS)

Westérmn Northern Cenfral |
BASE PRICE: -~ No bid - -~ No bid - - No bid --

Optional equipment - specify

Southern
-- No bid --

b | Optional equipment - specify. .. ) N
Optional equipment - specify -
o " [Optional equipment - specify: - <.« R S
Optional equipment - specify ‘
E< . i Optional equipment - specify .. L= 7 ,
i - | Opticnal equipment - specify
r—w O};iib'na] equipment - specify s )
. Optional equipment - specify
(7 T *| Optional équipméit - specify < - L T e I ‘ :
Optional equipment - specify
{’;“ . | Temporary tag: "0 . . L SR
Transfer existing registration (fnust provide tag number) T h
- . | New state tag (specify state; counity, city, shefiff, etc)) . " o 5
| Maintenance Plan - specify
E_" - +* | Maintendnce Plan - specify « -~ .o v K
Warranty - specify
e WamantySspecify . o T o s i TR S i

e e SRS S % Lt




H

Ring Power Corporation
500 World Commerce Parkway
St. Augustine, FL 32092

QUOTE PER THE FLORIDA SHERIFF'S ASSOCIATION CONTRACT

" Quote Prepared For: 1/9/2019
St Johns County
{1) NEW CATERPILLAR 926M WHEEL LOADER -
CONTRACT DETAILS -
Florida Sheriff's Association
Bid # FSA18-VEH16.0 .
Specification # 33, 3.0 Cu. Yd. Wheel Loader and Options _
Effective Dates: October 1, 2018 Through September 30, 2019
BASE MACHINE
‘BASE Caterpillar 926M Per Sheriff's Contract Specifications $139,837
TOTAL OF BASE MACHINE $139,837 T

.MACHINE SPECIFICATIONS

430-2943 ~ PREP PACK, UNITED STATES

- 430-2821 HYD,2V,PIN-ON,STD LIFT

| 430-2996 . STEERING, STANDARD -

' 333-6528 DIFFERENTIAL, OPEN REAR
430-2855 ENVIRONMENT, STANDARD
454-0609 WEATHER, STANDARD

| 430-3038 ENGINE-AR

423-7152 CAB, STANDARD
423-7200 SEAT, STANDARD
488-1112 LIGHTS, STD HALOGEN
343-0130 RADIO, READY
454-0589 . PRODUCT LINK, CELLULAR PL641
366-6895 TIRES, 20.5R25 MX XTLA * L2
366-8148 FENDERS, STANDARD
348-2579 COUNTERWEIGHT, HEAVY .
0P-2491 KIT,SERIALIZED TECHNICAL MEDIA ;
345-2824 BUCKET, GP, 3.2YD3 PO

8E-4566 CUTTING EDGE, BOLT ON({4 PIECE) |




SPECIFIED OPTIONS

333-1369 RADIO, CD, DELUXE $632
5213244 CAB, DELUXE, A/C $1,980°
377-5635 CAMERA, REAR VIEW $702
349-8165 GUARD, POWERTRAIN, LOWER $915
425-1425 GUARD, POWERTRAIN, SIDE $356
349-8163 GUARD, CRANKCASE $629
488-1113 LIGHTS, AUX HALOGEN $258
430-2823 HYD,3V,COUPLER READY,STD LIFT 41,757
430-2977 QUICK COUPLER, FUSION $2,752 .
' . TOTAL OF SPECIFIED OPTIONS $9,981
NON-SPECIFIED OPTIONS
349-7940 " GUARD, DRIVESHAFT $605
LESS 25% SHERIFE'S CONTRACT DISCOUNT ($151)
TOTAL OF NON-SPECIFIED OPTIONS $454
CAT WORK TOOLS
| 345-2824 BUCKET, GP, 3.2YD3, PO ($9,033)
345-2784 BUCKET, GP, 3.2YD3, FUS $9,340
345-2750 FORK, 72" CONSTRUCTION $10,640
SUBTOTAL $10,947
LESS 16% SHERIFF CONTRACT DISCOUNT ($1,752)
TOTAL OF CAT WORK TOOLS $9,195 |
NON CONTRACT OPTIONS
ROCKLAND BRUSH HANDLING GRAPPLE RAKE $22,180 -
LESS 3% ROCKLAND DISCOUNT. ($665)
LINCOLN AUTOMATIC LUBE SYSTEM - $8,500
60 MONTH / 2500 HOUR PREMIER WARRANTY . $3,060
2500 HR PREVENTATIVE MAINTAINANCE PROGRAM 44,694
TOTAL OF NON CONTRACT OPTIONS $37,769 |-
SUB TOTAL "4197,236
LESS ONE TIME ADDITIONAL DISCOUNT ‘ ($1,080)
TOTAL TRANSACTION PRICE $196,156 |

Best regards,

Shaun Mitchell
Sales Representative
~ Ring Power Corporation



