RESOLUTION NO. 2023 - 7% H

A RESOLUTION OF THE .OARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS OF
ST. JOHNS COUNTY, FLORIDA, AUTHORIZING THE COUNTY
ADMINISTRATOR, OR DESIGNEE, TO APPROVE THE TRANSFER OF
UNUSED PARK IMPACT FEE CREDITS FROM THE MARSHALL
CREEK PUD TO RAVENSWOOD VILLAGE.

WHEREAS, pursuant § 163.31801, Fla. Stat. (2021), the COUNTY imposes
impact fees to ensu that new development bears a proportionate share of the cost of
roads, parks, schools and public capital facilities necessary to serve the new
development; and

WHEREAS, § 163.31801(10), Fla. Stat. (2021) allows for the transfer of unused
impact fee credits to other developments unc - certain conditions; and

WHEREAS, the COUNTY, the de oper of the Marshall Creek PUD
(DEVELOF™R) and the Marshall Creek CDD (CDD) entered into that certain Impact
Fee Credit Agreement (Agreement) on October 27, 2005 and recorded in Ordinance
Book 2592, Page 1942 of the Official Records of St. Johns County, Florida; and

WHEREAS, Section 6 of the Agreement allows for the assignment of unused
park impact fee credits, subject to the approval of the COUNTY; and

WHEREAS, Section 13 of the Park Impact Fee Ordinance 87-58 provides that
impact fee credits cannot be transferred without approval of the COUNTY; and

WHEREAS, the [ .OPER and CDD have reqt ;ted to transfer $166,870.00
in unused park impact fee credits to Ravenswood Village development; and

WHEREAS, the Marshall Creek PUD is located in Impact Fee District 2, which is
adjoining Impact Fee District 3 where the Ravenswood Village development is located,
and

WHEREAS, the recreation improvement which genera 1 the impact fee credits
awarded to the Marshall Creek PUD is ¢ ssified ¢ a Community Park, but includes
some elements of a District Park; and

WHEREAS, the level of service for parks and recreation within the St. Johns
County Comprehensive Plan is a County-wide rel of service; and

WHERE/ as a )ndition of the proposed t 1sfer, the DEVELC :R 1d CDD
are required to provide the County a copy of the instrument selling, transferring,
assigning or granting the above-described allocation of Park Impact Fee Credits; and

WHEREAS, transferred credits may only be applied to park impact fees due and
may not be used to satisfy concurrency or other mitigation, if required; and






SUPPORTING DOCUMENTS
IMPACT FEE CREDIT TRANSFER REQUEST
APPLICANT’S JUSTIFICATION STATEMENT

and

AGREEMENT



velope ID: 2 '5C90-B78F- A4F 3

Marshall “'reek T «d

June 09, 2023

Jan Tre ham

Lisa Brown

. .ansportation Department
St. Johns County

Re:  Transfer of Park Impact Fees Request
Ma all Creek Park Impact Fee Agreement
Resolution 2005-295
Transfer to:  Ravenswood

Dear Jan and Lisa,

Marshall Creek, Ltd. still holds $1,012,517.25 in park impact fee credits and Marshall Creek, CDD
still holds $784,261.35 in park impact fee credits per the terms of the Impact Fee Credit
Agreement dated October 27, 2005, as memorialized in the St. Johns County public records as
Resolution 2005-95. Please allow this letter to serve as a formal request to transfer a portion of
the credit balance as shown below in park impact fees to a nearby project known as Ravenswood
with hom« being cot ruc | by D.R. Horton, Inc. No formal transfer will occur until Marshall
Creek, Ltd and Marshall Creek CDD each execute definitive documents enacting the transfers.

Beth Breeding will be assisting as agent with this transfer.

Transfer from: Transfer to:

Marshall Creek, | td. D.R. Horton, Inc. Ravenswood
Marshall Creek C_ D D.R. Horton, Inc. Ravenswood
Sincerely,

vd by
L 8Slaa
AS4AD1C..

¥V QI O,Shea

Senior Managing Director

Authorized representative of Marshall Creek, Ltd

Amount;
$94,114.68
$72,755.32

11512 Lake Mead Avenue, Suite 603 | Jacksonville, FL 32256 | P: 904-299-7020



n_ oW sl

From: Beth Breeding <bethbrdn¢  jmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, June 1, 2023 12:13 PM

To: Jan Trantham,; Lisa Brown

Cc: '‘Beth Breeding'; Angie Mardini; ‘O'Shea, Walter'; 'Hines, Kellie'; '"Mark C. Dearing’; 'Brett
Stephen Infante'

Subject: Park Impact Fee Transfer Request

Attachments: Rationale for transfer.pdf

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

From: Beth Breeding <bethbrdng@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, May 23, 2023 4:29 PM

To: Jan Trantham' <jtrantham@sjcfl.us>; 'Lisa Brown' <lbrown@sjcfl.us>

Cc: 'Hines, Kellie' <Kellie.Hines@hines.com>; '0O'Shea, Walter' <Walter.0'Shea@hines.com>; 'Brett Stephen infante'
<BSInfante@drhorton.com>; 'Mark C. Dearing' <MCDearingl@drhorton.com>; Angie Mardini

<angii " silverfieldgroup.cc  >; 'Beth Breeding' <bethbrdng@gmail.com>

Subject: Park Impact Fee Transfer Request

Jan and Lisa,

Please find enclosed a request to transfer park impact fee credits from one project to four other projects. |
have included the Impact Fee Credit Agreement as well as 4 separate request letters, one for each project
transfer requested. | have also included an accounting sheet for the beginning impact fee credit balances with
deductions for each request and what would be remaining to the original credit holder.

























































